



**Southeast Florida Governmental Purchasing
Cooperative Group**

CONTRACT AWARD

Please complete each of the applicable boxes and submit with bid documents, award notices and tabulations to lpiper@myboca.us for placement on the NIGP SEFL website Cooperative contract page.

PAGE 1 OF 2

BID/RFP No. E-34-15

Description/Title: Mulch

Initial Contract Term: Start Date: 09/16/2015 End Date: 09/15/2016

Renewal Terms of the Contract: 1 (No. of Renewals) Renewal Options for 1-year (Period of Time)

Renewal No. 1 Start Date: 09/16/2016 End Date: 09/15/2017

Renewal No. Start Date: End Date:

Renewal No. Start Date: End Date:

SECTION #1 VENDOR AWARD

Vendor Name: Advanced Mulch, Inc. (Item 9)

Vendor Address: PO Box 32943, Palm Beach Gardens, FL 33420

Contact: Dawn Corrado, Office Manager

Phone: 877-256-9685 Fax: 561-733-1317

Cell/Pager: 561-722-1880 Email Address: info@advancedmulch.com

Website: www.advancedmulch.com FEIN: 65-0916255

VENDOR AWARD

Vendor Name: Adwood, Inc. (Items 1, 2, 6, 12)

Vendor Address: 4670 NW 69th Avenue, Miami, FL 33166

Contact: Arturo Liza, Manager; Edwin (back-up)

Phone: 561-248-0289 (back-up) Fax: 561-965-9777

Cell/Pager: 561-436-1885 Email Address: info@adwooddistribution.com

Website: adwooddistribution.com/home.html FEIN: 65-0624013

VENDOR AWARD

Vendor Name: Amerigrow Recycling (Item 5)
Vendor Address: 10320 W. Atlantic Avenue, Delray Beach, FL 33446
Contact: Joanie Vertefeuille, Sales and Marketing
Phone: 561-499-8148 Fax: 561-499-5896
Cell/Pager: _____ Email Address: Joanie@amerigrow.com
Website: www.amerigrow.com FEIN: 16-1480138

VENDOR AWARD

Vendor Name: Bliss Products & Services
Vendor Address: 6831 S Sweetwater Road, Lithia, Georgia 30122
Contact: Patty Carruthers, Sales Associate
Phone: 239-248-6430 Fax: 239-430-0125
Cell/Pager: _____ Email Address: patty@blissproducts.com
Website: www.blisproducts.com FEIN: _____

VENDOR AWARD

Vendor Name: Eastcoast Mulch
Vendor Address: PO Box 1352, Jupiter, FL 33468
Contact: George Henry, Director of Operations/Vice President
Phone: 561-627-5539 Fax: 561-972-7673
Cell/Pager: 561-262-0075 Email Address: rcmr@comcast.net
Website: _____ FEIN: 65-0876231

VENDOR AWARD

Vendor Name: Superior Mulch
Vendor Address: 9621 SR #7, Boynton Beach
Contact: Carol Marrero
Phone: 561-734-7300 Fax: 561-734-3013
Cell/Pager: _____ Email Address: carol@atlaspeatandsoil.com
Website: _____ FEIN: 59-2712633

SECTION #2 **AWARD/BACKGROUND INFORMATION**

Award Date: 7/28/15 Resolution/Agenda Item No.: 7-28-15 / #4
Insurance Required: Yes X No _____
Performance Bond Required: Yes _____ No X

SECTION #3 **LEAD AGENCY**

Agency Name: City of Pompano Beach
Agency Address: 1190 NE 3rd Avenue, Bldg. C, Pompano Beach, FL. 33060
Agency Contact: Jeff English Email jeffrey.english@copbfl.com
Telephone: 954-786-4098 Fax: 954-786-4168



**City of Pompano Beach, Purchasing Division
1190 N.E. 3rd Avenue, Building C
Pompano Beach, Florida, 33060**

July 31, 2015

Arleen Araguez, President
Adwood, Inc.
4670 N.W. 69th Avenue
Miami, Florida 33166

Via (561) 965-9777 and Email info@adwooddistribution.com

Dear Ms. Araguez,

The City Commission, at their July 28, 2015 meeting, agenda item #4, approved award of open-end contracts at the unit prices bid for E-34-15, Mulch (Co-operative Bid). Primary contract awards were made to the following companies for the indicated Bid items:

| | |
|----------------------------|-------------------|
| Advanced Mulch, Inc., | Item 9 |
| Adwood, Inc., | Items 1, 2, 6, 12 |
| Amerigrow Recycling, | Item 5 |
| Bliss Products & Services, | Item 7 |
| Eastcoast Mulch, | Items 8, 10, 11, |
| Superior Mulch, | Items 3, 4, 13 |

Awards were also approved to the remaining responsive bidders for each item, to be used as alternate sources if the primary vendor is unable to supply the product. All responsive bidders are listed on the enclosed bid tabulation.

The contract period shall be one year, from September 16, 2015 through September 15, 2016. The City will place orders for mulch, as needed, throughout the contract period at the unit prices bid. The specifications, terms, and conditions of the Bid shall remain firm for the initial contract period, and any renewal period. Contract renewal may be made as per terms contained in the Bid document.

Page 2

A copy of this letter, and additional bid information will be distributed to each participating Southeast Florida Governmental Purchasing Co-operative member. Each participating entity is responsible for issuing its own contract, purchase order, payment, etc.

Sincerely,

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Jeff English". The signature is written in a cursive, flowing style.

Jeff English
Purchasing Agent

enclosure

cc: Harold "Hal" Beard, Assistant Public Works Director
Co-op
file



**City of Pompano Beach, Purchasing Division
1190 N.E. 3rd Avenue, Building C
Pompano Beach, Florida, 33060**

July 31, 2015

Kenneth Bowden, President
Advanced Mulch, Inc.
P.O. Box 32943
Palm Beach Gardens, FL 33420

Via Facsimile (561) 733-1317 and Email info@advancedmulch.com

Dear Mr. Bowden,

The City Commission, at their July 28, 2015 meeting, agenda item #4, approved award of open-end contracts at the unit prices bid for E-34-15, Mulch (Co-operative Bid). Primary contract awards were made to the following companies for the indicated Bid items:

| | |
|----------------------------|-------------------|
| Advanced Mulch, Inc., | Item 9 |
| Adwood, Inc., | Items 1, 2, 6, 12 |
| Amerigrow Recycling, | Item 5 |
| Bliss Products & Services, | Item 7 |
| Eastcoast Mulch, | Items 8, 10, 11, |
| Superior Mulch, | Items 3, 4, 13 |

Awards were also approved to the remaining responsive bidders for each item, to be used as alternate sources if the primary vendor is unable to supply the product. All responsive bidders are listed on the enclosed bid tabulation.

The contract period shall be one year, from September 16, 2015 through September 15, 2016. The City will place orders for mulch, as needed, throughout the contract period at the unit prices bid. The specifications, terms, and conditions of the Bid shall remain firm for the initial contract period, and any renewal period. Contract renewal may be made as per terms contained in the Bid document.

Page 2

A copy of this letter, and additional bid information will be distributed to each participating Southeast Florida Governmental Purchasing Co-operative member. Each participating entity is responsible for issuing its own contract, purchase order, payment, etc.

Sincerely,

Jeff English
Purchasing Agent

enclosure

cc: Harold "Hal" Beard, Assistant Public Works Director
Co-op
file



**City of Pompano Beach, Purchasing Division
1190 N.E. 3rd Avenue, Building C
Pompano Beach, Florida, 33060**

July 31, 2015

David Tomlinson, Vice President
Amerigrow Recycling
10320 W. Atlantic Avenue
Delray Beach, Florida 33446

Via Facsimile (561) 499-5896 and Email info@amerigrow.com

Dear Mr. Tomlinson,

The City Commission, at their July 28, 2015 meeting, agenda item #4, approved award of open-end contracts at the unit prices bid for E-34-15, Mulch (Co-operative Bid). Primary contract awards were made to the following companies for the indicated Bid items:

| | |
|----------------------------|-------------------|
| Advanced Mulch, Inc., | Item 9 |
| Adwood, Inc., | Items 1, 2, 6, 12 |
| Amerigrow Recycling, | Item 5 |
| Bliss Products & Services, | Item 7 |
| Eastcoast Mulch, | Items 8, 10, 11, |
| Superior Mulch, | Items 3, 4, 13 |

Awards were also approved to the remaining responsive bidders for each item, to be used as alternate sources if the primary vendor is unable to supply the product. All responsive bidders are listed on the enclosed bid tabulation.

The contract period shall be one year, from September 16, 2015 through September 15, 2016. The City will place orders for mulch, as needed, throughout the contract period at the unit prices bid. The specifications, terms, and conditions of the Bid shall remain firm for the initial contract period, and any renewal period. Contract renewal may be made as per terms contained in the Bid document.

Page 2

A copy of this letter, and additional bid information will be distributed to each participating Southeast Florida Governmental Purchasing Co-operative member. Each participating entity is responsible for issuing its own contract, purchase order, payment, etc.

Sincerely,

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Jeff English". The signature is written in a cursive style with a large initial "J".

Jeff English
Purchasing Agent

enclosure

cc: Harold "Hal" Beard, Assistant Public Works Director
Co-op
file



**City of Pompano Beach, Purchasing Division
1190 N.E. 3rd Avenue, Building C
Pompano Beach, Florida, 33060**

July 31, 2015

Gregg Bliss, President
Bliss Products and Services, Inc.
6831 S. Sweetwater Rd.
Lithia Springs, Georgia 30122

Via Facsimile (866) 920-1915 and Email info@blissproducts.com

Dear Mr. Bliss,

The City Commission, at their July 28, 2015 meeting, agenda item #4, approved award of open-end contracts at the unit prices bid for E-34-15, Mulch (Co-operative Bid). Primary contract awards were made to the following companies for the indicated Bid items:

| | |
|----------------------------|-------------------|
| Advanced Mulch, Inc., | Item 9 |
| Adwood, Inc., | Items 1, 2, 6, 12 |
| Amerigrow Recycling, | Item 5 |
| Bliss Products & Services, | Item 7 |
| Eastcoast Mulch, | Items 8, 10, 11, |
| Superior Mulch, | Items 3, 4, 13 |

Awards were also approved to the remaining responsive bidders for each item, to be used as alternate sources if the primary vendor is unable to supply the product. All responsive bidders are listed on the enclosed bid tabulation.

The contract period shall be one year, from September 16, 2015 through September 15, 2016. The City will place orders for mulch, as needed, throughout the contract period at the unit prices bid. The specifications, terms, and conditions of the Bid shall remain firm for the initial contract period, and any renewal period. Contract renewal may be made as per terms contained in the Bid document.

Page 2

A copy of this letter, and additional bid information will be distributed to each participating Southeast Florida Governmental Purchasing Co-operative member. Each participating entity is responsible for issuing its own contract, purchase order, payment, etc.

Sincerely,

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Jeff English". The signature is written in a cursive, flowing style.

Jeff English
Purchasing Agent

enclosure

cc: Harold "Hal" Beard, Assistant Public Works Director
Co-op
file



**City of Pompano Beach, Purchasing Division
1190 N.E. 3rd Avenue, Building C
Pompano Beach, Florida, 33060**

July 31, 2015

George Henry, Director of Operations
Eastcoast Mulch
P.O. Box 1352
Jupiter, Florida 33468

Via Facsimile (561) 972-7673 and Email rcmr@comcast.net

Dear Mr. Henry,

The City Commission, at their July 28, 2015 meeting, agenda item #4, approved award of open-end contracts at the unit prices bid for E-34-15, Mulch (Co-operative Bid). Primary contract awards were made to the following companies for the indicated Bid items:

| | |
|----------------------------|-------------------|
| Advanced Mulch, Inc., | Item 9 |
| Adwood, Inc., | Items 1, 2, 6, 12 |
| Amerigrow Recycling, | Item 5 |
| Bliss Products & Services, | Item 7 |
| Eastcoast Mulch, | Items 8, 10, 11, |
| Superior Mulch, | Items 3, 4, 13 |

Awards were also approved to the remaining responsive bidders for each item, to be used as alternate sources if the primary vendor is unable to supply the product. All responsive bidders are listed on the enclosed bid tabulation.

The contract period shall be one year, from September 16, 2015 through September 15, 2016. The City will place orders for mulch, as needed, throughout the contract period at the unit prices bid. The specifications, terms, and conditions of the Bid shall remain firm for the initial contract period, and any renewal period. Contract renewal may be made as per terms contained in the Bid document.

Page 2

A copy of this letter, and additional bid information will be distributed to each participating Southeast Florida Governmental Purchasing Co-operative member. Each participating entity is responsible for issuing its own contract, purchase order, payment, etc.

Sincerely,

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Jeff English". The signature is written in a cursive, flowing style.

Jeff English
Purchasing Agent

enclosure

cc: Harold "Hal" Beard, Assistant Public Works Director
Co-op
file



**City of Pompano Beach, Purchasing Division
1190 N.E. 3rd Avenue, Building C
Pompano Beach, Florida, 33060**

July 31, 2015

Brian J. Lulfs, President
Superior Mulch
9621 SR #7
Boynton Beach, Florida 33472

Via Facsimile (561) 734-3013 and Email carol@atlaspeatandsoil.com

Dear Mr. Lulfs,

The City Commission, at their July 28, 2015 meeting, agenda item #4, approved award of open-end contracts at the unit prices bid for E-34-15, Mulch (Co-operative Bid). Primary contract awards were made to the following companies for the indicated Bid items:

| | |
|----------------------------|-------------------|
| Advanced Mulch, Inc., | Item 9 |
| Adwood, Inc., | Items 1, 2, 6, 12 |
| Amerigrow Recycling, | Item 5 |
| Bliss Products & Services, | Item 7 |
| Eastcoast Mulch, | Items 8, 10, 11, |
| Superior Mulch, | Items 3, 4, 13 |

Awards were also approved to the remaining responsive bidders for each item, to be used as alternate sources if the primary vendor is unable to supply the product. All responsive bidders are listed on the enclosed bid tabulation.

The contract period shall be one year, from September 16, 2015 through September 15, 2016. The City will place orders for mulch, as needed, throughout the contract period at the unit prices bid. The specifications, terms, and conditions of the Bid shall remain firm for the initial contract period, and any renewal period. Contract renewal may be made as per terms contained in the Bid document.

Page 2

A copy of this letter, and additional bid information will be distributed to each participating Southeast Florida Governmental Purchasing Co-operative member. Each participating entity is responsible for issuing its own contract, purchase order, payment, etc.

Sincerely,

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Jeff English". The signature is written in a cursive, flowing style.

Jeff English
Purchasing Agent

enclosure

cc: Harold "Hal" Beard, Assistant Public Works Director
Co-op
file

Meeting Date: 7/28/15

Agenda Item 4

REQUESTED COMMISSION ACTION:

Consent Ordinance Resolution Consideration/Discussion Presentation

SHORT TITLE Approval to award Bid #E-34-15, Mulch (Cooperative), to the low responsive bidders, Advanced Mulch, (Item 9), Adwood, (Items 1, 2, 6,12), Amerigrow, (Item 5), Bliss Products, (Item 7), Eastcoast Mulch, (Items 8, 10, 11), and Superior Mulch (Items 3, 4, 13) as prime contractors, and to the other responsive bidders as alternate contractors, for annual open-end contracts. The estimated cost to the City for mulch is \$54,000.00

Summary of Purpose and Why:

Bid E-34-15 was issued to establish annual open-end contracts for the purchase of mulch products for grounds maintenance to be ordered as needed. The bid includes dyed recycled wood, Melaleuca, rubber mulch, playground wood chips and wood fiber, delivered and installed. The City of Pompano Beach issued this bid as the lead agency for the South Florida Governmental Purchasing Cooperative, on behalf of the City and twenty-five other governmental agencies. Primary bid award is recommended to the low responsive bidder per item, and alternate bid awards to the remaining responsive bidders to be used should the material be unavailable from the primary contractors, all awards at the unit prices bid. Based upon the prices bid, and the City's portion of the estimated contract usage, annual expenditures for mulch products could total \$54,000.00. The contract period is one year, commencing upon award by the Commission, with contract renewal possible as stated in the bid specifications. City Commission approval of this contract award is requested.

- (1) Origin of request for this action: Staff
- (2) Primary staff contact: Robert McCaughan 954 786-4097
- (3) Expiration of contract, if applicable: n/a
- (4) Fiscal impact and source of funding: As needed, from budgeted funds in account 001-3060-530.46-10
Repair & Maintenance / Land Building Improvements

| DEPARTMENTAL COORDINATION | DATE | DEPARTMENTAL RECOMMENDATION | DEPARTMENTAL HEAD SIGNATURE |
|---------------------------|----------------|-----------------------------|--|
| Public Works | <u>7/17/15</u> | <u>APPROVE</u> | <u>Robert McCaughan</u> |
| General Services | <u>7-17-15</u> | <u>Approve</u> | <u>Cassandra LeMay for Otis Thomas</u> |
| Finance | <u>7-17-15</u> | <u>Approve</u> | <u>Bob Sibble</u> |
| Budget | <u>7-17-15</u> | <u>Approval</u> | <u>[Signature]</u> |

[Signature]
X City Manager

[Signature]

ACTION TAKEN BY COMMISSION:

| Ordinance | Resolution | Consideration | Workshop |
|-------------------------|-------------------------|---------------|----------|
| 1 st Reading | 1 st Reading | Results: | Results: |
| 2 nd Reading | | | |

MEMORANDUM

Purchasing #15-097
July 16, 2015

To: Dennis W. Beach, City Manager
Through: Otis J. Thomas, General Services Director *CL for OT*
From: Jeff English, Purchasing Agent *JE*
Subject: Award Bid E-34-15 Mulch (Cooperative Bid)

Contract Need/Background

The City of Pompano Beach issued Bid E-34-15 to establish an annual contract for the purchase of mulch products, to be ordered as needed. Products included in the bid are mulch made of recycled wood dyed brown and red, both delivered and installed, Melaleuca and rubber mulch, delivered, and playground wood chips and engineered wood fiber, delivered and installed. Pompano Beach issued this bid as the lead agency, on behalf of the City and twenty-five other governmental agencies in the South Florida Governmental Purchasing Cooperative. The estimated quantities stated in the bid solicitation include anticipated requirements from all of the participating agencies, including the City of Pompano Beach.

The City's Public Works Department requires mulch on an ongoing basis for use in landscaping throughout the city. The Public Works Department recommends the contract be awarded to the low bidder for each bid item as the primary contractor:

- Advanced Mulch, Inc., Item 9
- Adwood, Inc., Items 1, 2, 6, 12
- Amerigrow Recycling, Item 5
- Bliss Products & Services, Item 7
- Eastcoast Mulch, Items 8, 10, 11
- Superior Mulch, Items 3, 4, 13

Awards are also recommended to the remaining responsive bidders for each item, to be used as alternate sources if the primary vendor is unable to supply the product. It is anticipated that most orders will be placed with the primary awardee for each item to achieve the lowest cost to the City and Cooperative.

Attached you will find copies of the memorandum and the bid award recommendation form submitted by the Public Works Department, the bid tabulation, and solicitation document.

Bidders List

The Bidders List was created by using companies suggested by the requesting department, companies that have responded to prior bids, companies that have requested their names be placed on the Bid List, and companies from appropriate listings in other source books.

Number of firms responding with complete bids.....8

Advertising

The Bid was advertised in the Sun Sentinel, and notices were sent to bid notice agencies throughout the nation. The Bid package was also posted on the City's web page for download by interested firms.

Funding

The total annual value of this contract award based on the combined estimated annual quantities of the twenty-five participating co-op agencies, and the City of Pompano Beach, is \$906,271.85. Based upon the unit prices bid, and the City's estimated usage, the City of Pompano Beach annual expenditures for mulch products could total \$54,000.00. City purchases will be made, as needed, from budgeted funds in account, 001-3060-530.46-10, Repair & Maintenance / Land Building Improvements.

Award Recommendation

It is recommended that a one-year contract award be made to the low bidder per item as the primary awardee as follows: Advanced Mulch, (Item 9), Adwood, (Items 1, 2, 6, 12), Amerigrow, (Item 5), Bliss Products & Services, (Item 7), Eastcoast Mulch, (Items 8, 10, 11), Superior Mulch, (Items 3, 4, 13). Alternate awards are recommended to the remaining bidders as outlined on the bid tabulation to be used if the primary contractor is unable to supply the product. The contract may be renewed for additional one-year periods, subject to the terms and conditions contained in the bid specifications.

enclosures

cc: file

MEMORANDUM

Date: July 16, 2015
To: Otis J. Thomas, General Services Director
From: Robert McCaughan, Public Works Director *RM*
Subject: Award Bid E-34-15 Mulch (Cooperative Bid)

On July 15, 2015, the City opened and received bids for the Mulch Cooperative Bid E-34-15. Primary bid award is recommended to the low bidders per item, and alternate bid awards to the remaining responsive bidders per item.

The Grounds Maintenance Division utilizes over 3600 cubic yards of mulch annually to control weeds along our highway median flowerbeds and throughout the City. By reducing maintenance lawn crews' time spent pulling weeds, continued usage of mulch will greatly increase the Maintenance Division's productivity.

The mulch will be funded from account number 001-3060-530.46-10 Repair & Maintenance / Land Building Improvements.

All references have been reviewed and are satisfactory. Please have the bid award recommendation for this project placed on the agenda for approval at the next available commission meeting.

cc: Hal Beard Assistant Public Works Director

BID AWARD RECOMMENDATION FORM

From: Purchasing Division Jeff English Date 7/16/15

To: Grounds Maintenance Department Attn.: Arnold McCray

Subject: Bid No. E-34-15 Item/service: MULCH [Cooperative Bid]

Attached is the Bid Tabulation for subject item/service requisitioned by your department. Please complete this form in order that proper presentation and recommendations may be made to the City Commission for its approval, as appropriate. Your response should be typed. Please return this form to the Purchasing Division within three weeks of receipt.

This form must be accompanied by a memorandum explaining the item/service to be purchased, what it will be used for, stating that it is either a replacement or an additional item, and any other pertinent information which might be requested by the City Commission. This memo should also contain a detailed justification if you are rejecting a low bidder (see below).

1. SOURCE OF FUNDS:

Budgeted Code: 001-3060-530.46-10

Title: Repair Maintenance-Land/Bldg. Improvements

2. RECOMMENDATION:

(a) Which bidder do you recommend?

Low bidder per item as primary contractor with alternate award to others.

(b) Is the recommended bid the lowest bid received?

Yes X No

Note: If you recommend award to other than the low bidder detailed justification must be furnished for rejection of all lower bids, in an accompanying memorandum.

(c) If references were required, were they checked?

Yes X No Not applicable for this bid

Signature: Robert A Mc Caugh

Date: 7/17/15

Title: Public Works Director
(Department Head)

CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

| Bidder: | Advanced Mulch Inc, P.O. Box 32943, Palm Beach Gardens, FL 33420 | Adwood, Inc, 4670 N.W. 69th Avenue, Miami, FI 33166 | Amerigrow Recycling - Delray, L.P., 10320 W. Atlantic Avenue, Delray Beach, FL 33446 | Bliss Products and Services, Inc 6831 S. Sweetwater Road, Lithia Springs, Fa 30122 |
|--|--|---|---|---|
| 1., Mulch, red, delivered in bulk, per CY: | no bid | \$15.00 | \$15.75 | no bid |
| Total for 18,950 cy: | no bid | \$284,250.00 | \$298,462.50 | no bid |
| # of yards per truckload minimum order | 100 yards 100 yards | | 100 yards 100 yards | |
| 2., Mulch, brown, delivered in bulk, per cy: | no bid | \$13.00 | \$15.95 | no bid |
| Total for 3,250 CY: | no bid | \$42,250.00 | \$51,837.50 | no bid |
| # of yards per truckload minimum order | 100 yards 100 yards | | 100 yards 100 yards | |
| 3., Mulch, red, delivered in bags, per bag: | no bid | no bid | no bid | no bid |
| Total for 12,680 bag: | no bid | no bid | no bid | no bid |
| # of bags per pallet minimum order | | | | |
| 4., Mulch, brown, delivered in bags, per bag: | no bid | no bid | no bid | no bid |
| Total for 5,060 bag: | no bid | no bid | no bid | no bid |
| # of bags per pallet minimum order | | | | |
| 5., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in bags, per bag: | no bid | no bid | \$1.49 | no bid |
| Total for 16,350 bag: | no bid | no bid | \$24,361.50 | no bid |
| # of bags per pallet minimum order | | | 75 bags 20 pallets | |

CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

| | Eastcoast Mulch, P.O. Box 1352, Jupiter FL 33468 | Forestry Resources Inc, 4353 Michigan Link, Fort Myers, FL 33916 | Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc, 2017 91st Street N.W., Bradenton, FL 34209 | Superior Mulch, 9621 S.R. #7, Boynton Beach, FL 33472 |
|--|--|--|--|---|
| Bidder: | | | | |
| 1., Mulch, red, delivered in bulk, per CY: | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$16.50 |
| Total for 18,950 cy: | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$312,675.00 |
| # of yards per truckload minimum order | | | | 100 cubic yards 100 cubic yards |
| 2., Mulch, brown, delivered in bulk, per cy: | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$17.00 |
| Total for 3,250 CY: | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$55,250.00 |
| # of yards per truckload minimum order | | | | 100 cubic yards 100 cubic yards |
| 3., Mulch, red, delivered in bags, per bag: | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$1.59 |
| Total for 12,680 bag: | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$20,161.20 |
| # of bags per pallet minimum order | | | | 80 bags 1600 bags |
| 4., Mulch, brown, delivered in bags, per bag: | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$1.59 |
| Total for 5,060 bag: | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$8,045.40 |
| # of bags per pallet minimum order | | | | 70 bags 1400 bags |
| 5., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in bags, per bag: | no bid | \$1.79 | no bid | \$1.50 |
| Total for 16,350 bag: | no bid | \$29,266.50 | no bid | \$24,525.00 |
| # of bags per pallet minimum order | | 100 cubic yards 100 cubic yards | | 80 cubic yards 1760 cubic yards |

CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

| | | | | |
|--|--|---|---|---|
| Bidder: | Advanced Mulch Inc, P.O. Box 32943, Palm Beach Gardens, FL 33420 | Adwood, Inc, 4670 N.W. 69th Avenue, Miami, FI 33166 | Amerigrow Recycling - Delray, L.P., 10320 W. Atlantic Avenue, Delray Beach, FL 33446 | Bliss Products and Services, Inc 6831 S. Sweetwater Road, Lithia Springs, Fa 30122 |
| 6., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in bulk, per cy: | no bid | \$13.50 | \$14.75 | no bid |
| Total for 1,100 cy: | no bid | \$14,850.00 | \$16,225.00 | no bid |
| # of yards per truckload minimum order | 100 cubic yards | 90 cubic yards | 90 cubic yards | |
| 7., Mulch, rubber, delivered in bags, per super sack: | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$569.00 |
| Total for 5 super sack: minimum order | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$2,845.00 |
| 8., Fibar Engineered Wood Fiber, installed, per cy: | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$54.50 |
| Total for 1,500 cy: minimum order | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$81,750.00 |
| 9., Playground Safety Wood Chips, installed, per cy: | \$30.45 | no bid | no bid | \$54.07 |
| Total for 4,075 cy: minimum order | \$124,083.75 | no bid | no bid | \$220,335.25 |
| 10., Mulch, brown, bulk, installed, per cy: | \$21.41 | no bid | \$28.00 | no bid |
| Total for 6,300 cy: minimum order | \$134,883.00 | no bid | \$176,400.00 | no bid |
| 11., Mulch, red, bulk, installed, per cy: | \$21.41 | no bid | \$28.00 | no bid |
| Total for 8,550 cy: minimum order | \$183,055.50 | no bid | \$239,400.00 | no bid |
| | 20 cubic yards | 60 cubic yards | 60 cubic yards | 100 cubic yards |

CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

| | | | | |
|--|--|--|--|---|
| Bidder: | Eastcoast Mulch, P.O. Box 1352, Jupiter FL 33468 | Forestry Resources Inc, 4353 Michigan Link, Fort Myers, FL 33916 | Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc, 2017 91st Street N.W., Bradenton, FL 34209 | Superior Mulch, 9621 S.R. #7, Boynton Beach, FL 33472 |
| 6., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in bulk, per cy: | no bid | \$16.90 | no bid | \$15.50 |
| Total for 1,100 cy: | no bid | \$18,590.00 | no bid | \$17,050.00 |
| # of yards per truckload minimum order | 80 bags | | | 100 bags |
| | 80 bags | | | 100 bags |
| 7., Mulch, rubber, delivered in bags, per super sack: | no bid | | no bid | no bid |
| Total for 5 super sack: minimum order | no bid | | no bid | no bid |
| 8., Fibar Engineered Wood Fiber, installed, per cy: | \$35.00 | | | \$56.61 |
| Total for 1,500 cy: minimum order | \$52,500.00 | | \$84,915.00 | no bid |
| | | | 100 cubic yards | |
| 9., Playground Safety Wood Chips, installed, per cy: | \$31.50 | | | \$56.61 |
| Total for 4,075 cy: minimum order | \$128,362.50 | | \$230,685.75 | no bid |
| | | | 100 cubic yards | |
| 10., Mulch, brown, bulk, installed, per cy: | \$21.00 | | no bid | no bid |
| Total for 6,300 cy: minimum order | \$132,300.00 | | no bid | no bid |
| | 25, 50 or 100 cubic yards | | | |
| 11., Mulch, red, bulk, installed, per cy: | \$21.00 | | no bid | no bid |
| Total for 8,550 cy: minimum order | \$179,550.00 | | no bid | no bid |
| | 25 cubic yards | | | |

CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

| | | | | |
|---|--|---|--|--|
| Bidder: | Advanced Mulch Inc, P.O. Box 32943, Palm Beach Gardens, FL 33420 | Adwood, Inc, 4670 N.W. 69th Avenue, Miami, FL 33166 | Amerigrow Recycling - Delray, L.P., 10320 W. Atlantic Avenue, Delray Beach, FL 33446 | Bliss Products and Services, Inc 6831 S. Sweetwater Road, Lithia Springs, Fa 30122 |
| 12., Mulch, gold, delivered in bulk, per cy: | no bid | \$15.00 | no bid | no bid |
| Total for 1,000 cy: | no bid | \$15,000.00 | no bid | no bid |
| # of yards per truckload minimum order | | 100 yards | | |
| | | 100 yards | | |
| 13., Mulch, cypress, brown, delivered in bags, per bag: | no bid | no bid | no bid | no bid |
| Total for 4,050 bag: | no bid | no bid | no bid | no bid |
| # of bags per pallet minimum order | | | | |
| Bulk/Bagged Delivery time a.r.o.: | n/a | 10 calendar days | 3 calendar days | 10-15 calendar days |
| Installed Delivery time a.r.o. | 7 calendar days | 14 calendar days | 21 calendar days | 10-15 calendar days |
| Vendor accept Purchase Card | yes | no | no | yes |
| Notes: | | | | |

CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

| | | | | |
|--|---|---|--|--|
| <p>Bidder: 12., Mulch, gold, delivered in bulk, per cy: Total for 1,000 cy: # of yards per truckload minimum order</p> | <p>Eastcoast Mulch, P.O. Box 1352, Jupiter FL 33468</p> | <p>Forestry Resources Inc, 4353 Michigan Link, Fort Myers, FL 33916</p> | <p>Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc, 2017 91st Street N.W., Bradenton, FL 34209</p> | <p>Superior Mulch, 9621 S.R. #7, Boynton Beach, FL 33472</p> |
| | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$17.50 |
| | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$17,500.00 |
| | | | | 100 yards |
| | | | | 100 yards |
| | | | | |
| | | | | |
| | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$1.50 |
| | no bid | no bid | no bid | \$6,075.00 |
| | | | | 80 bags |
| | | | | 1760 bags |
| | | | | |
| | n/a | 5-7 calendar days | 7 calendar days | 1-2 calendar days |
| Bulk/Bagged Delivery time a.r.o.: | n/a | 5-7 calendar days | 7 calendar days | n/a |
| Installed Delivery time a.r.o. | 2-3 calendar days | 5-7 calendar days | 7 calendar days | n/a |
| Vendor accept Purchase Card | no | no | yes | no |
| Notes: | bidder did not state minimum orders for items 8 and 9 | Additional Stops: \$75.00 per Stop | | |

Detail by Entity Name

Florida Profit Corporation

ADVANCED MULCH, INC.

Filing Information

Document Number P99000041433
FEI/EIN Number 650916255
Date Filed 05/03/1999
State FL
Status ACTIVE

Principal Address

9621 SR7
BOYNTON BEACH, FL 33437

Changed: 03/07/2007

Mailing Address

P.O. BOX 32943
PALM BEACH GARDENS, FL 33420-2943

Registered Agent Name & Address

GREG H. GLICKSTEIN ESQ.
54 SW BOCA BATON BLVD.
BOCA RATON, FL 33432

Name Changed: 03/28/2003

Address Changed: 03/28/2003

Officer/Director Detail

Name & Address

Title D

BOWDEN, KENNETH
P.O. BOX 32943
PALM BEACH GARDENS, FL 33420-2943

Title D

BOWDEN, KIMBERLY
P.O. BOX 32943
PALM BEACH GARDENS, FL 33420-2943

Annual Reports

| Report Year | Filed Date |
|--------------------|-------------------|
| 2013 | 01/28/2013 |
| 2014 | 01/23/2014 |
| 2015 | 02/23/2015 |

Document Images

02/23/2015 -- ANNUAL REPORT [View image in PDF format](#)

| | |
|---|--|
| 01/23/2014 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/28/2013 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/06/2012 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/16/2011 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/06/2010 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/06/2009 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/29/2008 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/07/2007 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/21/2006 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/03/2005 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 07/27/2004 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/28/2003 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/18/2002 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/10/2001 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/25/2000 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 05/03/1999 -- Domestic Profit | View image in PDF format |

2015 FLORIDA PROFIT CORPORATION ANNUAL REPORT

DOCUMENT# P99000041433

Entity Name: ADVANCED MULCH, INC.

Current Principal Place of Business:

9621 SR7
BOYNTON BEACH, FL 33437

Current Mailing Address:

P.O. BOX 32943
PALM BEACH GARDENS, FL 33420-2943

FEI Number: 65-0916255

Certificate of Status Desired: No

Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

GREG H. GLICKSTEIN ESQ.
54 SW BOCA BATON BLVD.
BOCA RATON, FL 33432 US

The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both, in the State of Florida.

SIGNATURE: _____

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent

Date

Officer/Director Detail :

| | |
|-----------------|----------------------------------|
| Title | D |
| Name | BOWDEN, KENNETH |
| Address | P.O. BOX 32943 |
| City-State-Zip: | PALM BEACH GARDENS FL 33420-2943 |

| | |
|-----------------|----------------------------------|
| Title | D |
| Name | BOWDEN, KIMBERLY |
| Address | P.O. BOX 32943 |
| City-State-Zip: | PALM BEACH GARDENS FL 33420-2943 |

I hereby certify that the information indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my electronic signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oath; that I am an officer or director of the corporation or the receiver or trustee empowered to execute this report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appears above, or on an attachment with all other like empowered.

SIGNATURE: KENNETH BOWDEN

PRESIDENT

02/23/2015

Electronic Signature of Signing Officer/Director Detail

Date

Detail by Entity Name

Florida Profit Corporation

ADWOOD,INC.

Filing Information

| | |
|-----------------------------|--------------|
| Document Number | P95000072461 |
| FEI/EIN Number | 650624013 |
| Date Filed | 09/18/1995 |
| State | FL |
| Status | ACTIVE |
| Last Event | AMENDMENT |
| Event Date Filed | 10/11/1999 |
| Event Effective Date | NONE |

Principal Address

4670 NW 69TH AVENUE
MIAMI, FL 33166

Changed: 07/01/2011

Mailing Address

PO Box 1390
Boynton Beach, FL 33425

Changed: 03/13/2015

Registered Agent Name & Address

ARAGUEZ, AILEEN
726 Presidential Dr
Boynton Beach, FL 33435

Name Changed: 07/01/2011

Address Changed: 03/13/2015

Officer/Director Detail

Name & Address

Title PD

ARAGUEZ, AILEEN
4670 NW 69TH AVENUE
MIAMI, FL 33166

Annual Reports

| Report Year | Filed Date |
|--------------------|-------------------|
| 2013 | 02/04/2013 |
| 2014 | 03/25/2014 |
| 2015 | 03/13/2015 |

Document Images

[03/13/2015 -- ANNUAL REPORT](#)

[03/25/2014 -- ANNUAL REPORT](#)

[View image in PDF format](#)

| | |
|---|--|
| 02/04/2013 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/23/2012 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 07/01/2011 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/06/2011 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 08/18/2010 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/12/2010 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/23/2009 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/30/2008 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/04/2007 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/11/2006 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/14/2005 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 05/10/2004 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/23/2003 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/10/2002 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/02/2001 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/13/2000 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 10/11/1999 -- Amendment | View image in PDF format |
| 01/23/1999 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/20/1998 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 05/16/1997 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 05/01/1996 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 09/18/1995 -- DOCUMENTS PRIOR TO 1997 | View image in PDF format |

2015 FLORIDA PROFIT CORPORATION ANNUAL REPORT

DOCUMENT# P95000072461

Entity Name: ADWOOD,INC.

Current Principal Place of Business:

4670 NW 69TH AVENUE
MIAMI, FL 33166

Current Mailing Address:

PO BOX 1390
BOYNTON BEACH, FL 33425 US

FEI Number: 65-0624013

Certificate of Status Desired: No

Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

ARAGUEZ, AILEEN
726 PRESIDENTIAL DR
BOYNTON BEACH, FL 33435 US

The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both, in the State of Florida.

SIGNATURE: _____

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent

_____ Date

Officer/Director Detail :

Title PD
Name ARAGUEZ, AILEEN
Address 4670 NW 69TH AVENUE
City-State-Zip: MIAMI FL 33166

I hereby certify that the information indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my electronic signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oath; that I am an officer or director of the corporation or the receiver or trustee empowered to execute this report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appears above, or on an attachment with all other like empowered.

SIGNATURE: AILEEN ARAGUEZ

PRESIDENT

03/13/2015

Electronic Signature of Signing Officer/Director Detail

Date

Detail by Entity Name**Foreign Profit Corporation**

AMERIGROW RECYCLING CORP.

Filing Information

| | |
|------------------------|--------------|
| Document Number | F95000003754 |
| FEI/EIN Number | 161480757 |
| Date Filed | 08/03/1995 |
| State | NY |
| Status | ACTIVE |

Principal Address10320 W. ATLANTIC AVENUE
DELRAY BEACH, FL 33446

Changed: 04/23/1996

Mailing Address10320 W. ATLANTIC AVENUE
DELRAY BEACH, FL 33446

Changed: 04/23/1996

Registered Agent Name & AddressTOMLINSON, CHARLES WIII
10320 W. ATLANTIC AVENUE
DELRAY BEACH, FL 33446

Address Changed: 04/23/1996

Officer/Director Detail**Name & Address**

Title PSD

TOMLINSON, JANET
10320 W ATLANTIC AVE
DELRAY BEACH, FL 33446

Title VTD

KEARNEY, SILVIA
10320 W ATLANTIC AVE
DELRAY BEACH, FL 33446

Title VP

TOMLINSON, DAVID
10320 W ATLANTIC AVE
DELRAY BEACH, FL 33446**Annual Reports**

| Report Year | Filed Date |
|--------------------|-------------------|
| 2013 | 02/04/2013 |
| 2014 | 03/11/2014 |
| 2015 | 02/17/2015 |

Document Images

| | |
|---|--|
| 02/17/2015 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/11/2014 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/04/2013 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/24/2012 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/19/2011 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/24/2010 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/21/2009 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/10/2008 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/02/2007 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/02/2006 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/06/2005 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/27/2004 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/14/2003 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/24/2002 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/26/2001 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/22/2000 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/02/1999 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 05/06/1998 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 08/12/1997 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/23/1996 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 08/03/1995 -- DOCUMENTS PRIOR TO 1997 | View image in PDF format |

2015 FOREIGN PROFIT CORPORATION ANNUAL REPORT

DOCUMENT# F95000003754

Entity Name: AMERIGROW RECYCLING CORP.

Current Principal Place of Business:

10320 W. ATLANTIC AVENUE
DELRAY BEACH, FL 33446

Current Mailing Address:

10320 W. ATLANTIC AVENUE
DELRAY BEACH, FL 33446 US

FEI Number: 16-1480757

Certificate of Status Desired: No

Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

TOMLINSON, CHARLES WIII
10320 W. ATLANTIC AVENUE
DELRAY BEACH, FL 33446 US

The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both, in the State of Florida.

SIGNATURE:

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent

Date

Officer/Director Detail :

Title PSD
Name TOMLINSON, JANET
Address 10320 W ATLANTIC AVE
City-State-Zip: DELRAY BEACH FL 33446

Title VTD
Name KEARNEY, SILVIA
Address 10320 W ATLANTIC AVE
City-State-Zip: DELRAY BEACH FL 33446

Title VP
Name TOMLINSON, DAVID
Address 10320 W ATLANTIC AVE
City-State-Zip: DELRAY BEACH FL 33446

I hereby certify that the information indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my electronic signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oath; that I am an officer or director of the corporation or the receiver or trustee empowered to execute this report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appears above, or on an attachment with all other like empowered.

SIGNATURE: JANET TOMLINSON

P

02/17/2015

Electronic Signature of Signing Officer/Director Detail

Date

Detail by Entity Name**Florida Profit Corporation**

BLISS PRODUCTS AND SERVICES, INC.

Filing Information

Document Number G95904
FEI/EIN Number 592413631
Date Filed 04/11/1984
State FL
Status ACTIVE

Principal Address

6831 S SWEETWATER RD
 LITHIA SPRINGS, GA 30122

Changed: 01/09/2004

Mailing Address

6831 S SWEETWATER RD
 LITHIA SPRINGS, GA 30122

Changed: 01/15/2008

Registered Agent Name & Address

CFRA, LLC
 100 S. ASHLEY DR.
 SUITE 400
 TAMPA, FL 33602

Name Changed: 06/12/2003

Address Changed: 05/19/2011

Officer/Director Detail**Name & Address**

Title P

BLISS, GREGG
 3805 NEW YORK AVE
 DOUGLASVILLE, GA 30135

Annual Reports

| Report Year | Filed Date |
|-------------|------------|
| 2013 | 03/21/2013 |
| 2014 | 01/08/2014 |
| 2015 | 01/07/2015 |

Document Images

| | |
|---|--|
| 01/07/2015 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/08/2014 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/21/2013 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |

| | |
|---|--|
| 01/03/2012 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/04/2011 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/04/2010 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/14/2009 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/15/2008 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/22/2007 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 07/11/2006 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/19/2005 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/09/2004 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 06/12/2003 -- Reg. Agent Change | View image in PDF format |
| 05/22/2003 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 05/28/2002 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/19/2001 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/20/2000 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/06/1999 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/16/1998 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/31/1997 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/01/1996 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/02/1995 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |

2015 FLORIDA PROFIT CORPORATION ANNUAL REPORT

DOCUMENT# G95904

Entity Name: BLISS PRODUCTS AND SERVICES, INC.

Current Principal Place of Business:

6831 S SWEETWATER RD
LITHIA SPRINGS, GA 30122

Current Mailing Address:

6831 S SWEETWATER RD
LITHIA SPRINGS, GA 30122 US

FEI Number: 59-2413631

Certificate of Status Desired: No

Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

CFRA, LLC
100 S. ASHLEY DR.
SUITE 400
TAMPA, FL 33602 US

The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both, in the State of Florida.

SIGNATURE: _____

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent

_____ Date

Officer/Director Detail :

Title P
Name BLISS, GREGG
Address 3805 NEW YORK AVE
City-State-Zip: DOUGLASVILLE GA 30135

I hereby certify that the information indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my electronic signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oath; that I am an officer or director of the corporation or the receiver or trustee empowered to execute this report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appears above, or on an attachment with all other like empowered.

SIGNATURE: GREGG BLISS

PRESIDENT

01/07/2015

_____ Electronic Signature of Signing Officer/Director Detail

_____ Date

Detail by Entity Name**Florida Profit Corporation**

EAST COAST MULCH CORP.

Filing Information

Document Number P98000099421
FEI/EIN Number 650876231
Date Filed 11/23/1998
State FL
Status ACTIVE

Principal Address

954 Dolphin Court
 JUPITER, FL 33458

Changed: 01/20/2015

Mailing Address

PO BOX 1352
 JUPITER, FL 33468

Changed: 03/31/2009

Registered Agent Name & Address

BOWDEN, RAYMOND
 954 Dolphin Court
 JUPITER, FL 33458

Name Changed: 03/08/2004

Address Changed: 01/20/2015

Officer/Director Detail**Name & Address**

Title P

BOWDEN, RAYMOND
 954 Dolphin Court
 JUPITER, FL 33458

Annual Reports

| Report Year | Filed Date |
|--------------------|-------------------|
| 2013 | 06/11/2013 |
| 2014 | 03/13/2014 |
| 2015 | 01/20/2015 |

Document Images

| | |
|---|--|
| 01/20/2015 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/13/2014 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 06/11/2013 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/10/2012 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |

| | |
|---|--|
| 04/20/2011 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/17/2010 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/31/2009 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/27/2008 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 05/01/2007 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/17/2006 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/11/2005 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/08/2004 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/10/2003 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 06/13/2002 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 05/29/2001 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 03/23/2000 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 09/07/1999 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 11/23/1998 -- Domestic Profit | View image in PDF format |

2015 FLORIDA PROFIT CORPORATION ANNUAL REPORT

DOCUMENT# P98000099421

Entity Name: EAST COAST MULCH CORP.

Current Principal Place of Business:

954 DOLPHIN COURT
JUPITER, FL 33458

Current Mailing Address:

PO BOX 1352
JUPITER, FL 33468

FEI Number: 65-0876231

Certificate of Status Desired: No

Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

BOWDEN, RAYMOND
954 DOLPHIN COURT
JUPITER, FL 33458 US

The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both, in the State of Florida.

SIGNATURE:

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent

Date

Officer/Director Detail :

Title P
Name BOWDEN, RAYMOND
Address 954 DOLPHIN COURT
City-State-Zip: JUPITER FL 33458

I hereby certify that the information indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my electronic signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oath; that I am an officer or director of the corporation or the receiver or trustee empowered to execute this report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appears above, or on an attachment with all other like empowered.

SIGNATURE: RAYMOND R BOWDEN

PRESIDENT

01/20/2015

Electronic Signature of Signing Officer/Director Detail

Date

Detail by Entity Name**Florida Profit Corporation**

SUPERIOR MULCH INC.

Filing Information

| | |
|-----------------------------|---------------------|
| Document Number | J25504 |
| FEI/EIN Number | 592712633 |
| Date Filed | 07/24/1986 |
| State | FL |
| Status | ACTIVE |
| Last Event | CANCEL ADM DISS/REV |
| Event Date Filed | 10/13/2004 |
| Event Effective Date | NONE |

Principal Address7457 PARK LANE
LAKE WORTH, FL 33449

Changed: 01/07/2009

Mailing Address7457 PARK LANE RD
LAKE WORTH, FL 33449

Changed: 01/07/2009

Registered Agent Name & AddressLANCIANESE, MICHELLE
7457 PARK LN RD
LAKE WORTH, FL 33449

Name Changed: 01/23/2002

Address Changed: 01/07/2009

Officer/Director Detail**Name & Address**

Title PD

LULFS, BRIAN
7457 PARK LN RD
LAKE WORTH, FL 33467

Title S

LANCIANESE, MICHELLE
8640 LANTANA ROAD
LAKE WORTH, FL 33467

Title V

VANREETH, KATHRYN
8640 LANTANA ROAD
LAKE WORTH, FL 33467

Title T

EPLING, ANN
8640 LANTANA ROAD
LAKE WORTH, FL 33467

Title V

CROTEAU, JULIE
8640 LANTANA ROAD
LAKE WORTH, FL 33467

Annual Reports

| Report Year | Filed Date |
|-------------|------------|
| 2013 | 02/11/2013 |
| 2014 | 01/08/2014 |
| 2015 | 01/10/2015 |

Document Images

| | |
|---|--|
| 01/10/2015 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/08/2014 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/11/2013 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/09/2012 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/17/2011 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/06/2010 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/07/2009 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/04/2008 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/07/2007 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/22/2006 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/02/2005 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 10/13/2004 -- REINSTATEMENT | View image in PDF format |
| 06/17/2004 -- Name Change | View image in PDF format |
| 01/16/2003 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 04/19/2002 -- Amendment | View image in PDF format |
| 01/23/2002 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/23/2001 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/20/2000 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/24/1999 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 02/02/1998 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/14/1997 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/24/1996 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |
| 01/27/1995 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format |

2015 FLORIDA PROFIT CORPORATION ANNUAL REPORT

DOCUMENT# J25504

Entity Name: SUPERIOR MULCH INC.

Current Principal Place of Business:

7457 PARK LANE
LAKE WORTH, FL 33449

Current Mailing Address:

7457 PARK LANE RD
LAKE WORTH, FL 33449

FEI Number: 59-2712633

Certificate of Status Desired: No

Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

LANCIANESE, MICHELLE
7457 PARK LN RD
LAKE WORTH, FL 33449 US

The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both, in the State of Florida.

SIGNATURE: _____

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent

_____ Date

Officer/Director Detail :

Title PD
Name LULFS, BRIAN
Address 7457 PARK LN RD
City-State-Zip: LAKE WORTH FL 33467

Title S
Name LANCIANESE, MICHELLE
Address 8640 LANTANA ROAD
City-State-Zip: LAKE WORTH FL 33467

Title V
Name VANREETH, KATHRYN
Address 8640 LANTANA ROAD
City-State-Zip: LAKE WORTH FL 33467

Title T
Name EPLING, ANN
Address 8640 LANTANA ROAD
City-State-Zip: LAKE WORTH FL 33467

Title V
Name CROTEAU, JULIE
Address 8640 LANTANA ROAD
City-State-Zip: LAKE WORTH FL 33467

I hereby certify that the information indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my electronic signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under oath; that I am an officer or director of the corporation or the receiver or trustee empowered to execute this report as required by Chapter 607, Florida Statutes; and that my name appears above, or on an attachment with all other like empowered.

SIGNATURE: MICHELLE LANCIANESE

SECRETARY

01/10/2015

Electronic Signature of Signing Officer/Director Detail

Date